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In work and in love, life has taught seasoned police officer Jack that closeness only leads to pain. But Jack is
wracked with guilt when his rookie partner Kevin is shot during an undercover assignment and dies in his
arms. Why didn’t he take the time to get to know the rookie a little?

At the funeral, Jack takes a liking to Kevin’s brother, Devin. But Jack knows making a connection can cause
more hurt, and living on opposite coasts is an added obstacle.

With his brother dead, Devin feels a responsibility to Kevin's pregnant widow, Marie. He packs up and
moves east, only to have Marie, outraged that he’s put his life on hold, slam the door in his face. Devin turns
to the only other person he knows in town. As much as it goes against his philosophies on life, Jack takes
him in without hesitation.

Their tentative exploration into romance is interrupted when Devin is mistaken for his dead brother and
taken captive. Just as Jack opens his heart, reality slams into him. But he can’t lose anyone else. More than
the need to simply save a captive drives Jack to find Devin and bring him home.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Tuttle:

The book You Can't Go Home Again can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. So why must we leave the good thing like a book You Can't Go Home Again?
Some of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim which book can give many details for us. It is
absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for
that, you are able to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book You Can't Go Home Again has
simple shape however you know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the enormous world by
start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

James Jean:

This book untitled You Can't Go Home Again to be one of several books that will best seller in this year,
that's because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this
specific book in the book retail store or you can order it via online. The publisher in this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Cell phone. So
there is no reason to you to past this publication from your list.

Raul Miller:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need more time to be go
through. You Can't Go Home Again can be your answer since it can be read by you who have those short
free time problems.

Darlene Kidd:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This particular book You Can't Go Home Again was multi-colored
and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book You Can't Go Home Again has many kinds or
genre. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and believe
you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it can make you feel
happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading this.
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