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“‘Magic’ is the operative word for this moody novella. The magic of Harry Houdini serves as an overriding
backdrop here, but another kind of magic permeates these pages—the magic of fine writing. Don’t expect the
usual linear plot, because there is no direct narrative. Vivid dreams, surreal images, hypnotic memories, all
serve to flesh out an unsettling tale that sweeps us into a new fictional dimension. Read The Box Jumper and
share the magic.” — William F. Nolan, author of Logan’s Run and screenwriter of Burnt Offerings “A
haunting tale of madness and mystery. Mannetti leads the reader through a thrilling maze of illusion and
scandal surrounding world-famous magician and psychic debunker, Harry Houdini. As elusive as a magic
trick, the story unfolds through the dubious memories of one of his former assistants who suffers from
various illnesses throughout the story. Mannetti’s words entice the reader to explore a lewd world of liars
and lust. As the layers of intrigue unfold, the reader is compelled to keep reading and isn’t disappointed.” —
Sèphera Girón, Flesh Failure, author of Flesh Failure and Captured Souls “In Lisa Mannetti’s magical The
Box Jumper, readers are treated to intriguing premises and finely wrought characterizations rooted in the
hazy past of a bygone America. As usual, Mannetti’s driving narrative propels this fascinating portrait of
illusionist Harry Houdini and the strange goings on in and around—even beyond—his world. Highly
recommended to all who love a great story, excellent writing, and memorable characters with a haunting
literary flair.” — Jason V. Brock, author of Milton’s Children and Disorders of Magnitude “Lisa Mannetti’s
The Box Jumper is a passionately told story of love, memory, and how we can be possessed by both.
Mannetti is, simply put, a master of the dark historical fantasy, and in The Box Jumper she has all her talents
on full display. The only really frustrating thing about her stories is how she manages to make perfection
look so easy.” — Joe McKinney, Bram Stoker Award-winning author of Dog Days and Plague of the
Undead “Lisa Mannetti has given us a look into the life of a fascinating historical character and cultural icon.
Her novella brims over with dark suspense and a brilliant re-creation of a New York long gone. As always,
she writes with passion and originality. A great story.” — Tom Monteleone, Bram Stoker and Locus Award-
winning author of Night of Broken Souls and Eyes of the Virgin
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Joyner:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or goal; it means that publication has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. What about the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or
maybe exercise. Well, probably you will want this The Box Jumper.

James Vazquez:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
when those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously which
one is acceptable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource
then you obtain it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities
will not happen throughout you if you take The Box Jumper as your daily resource information.

Sang O\'Connor:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specially book entitled The
Box Jumper your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe
unfamiliar for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a reserve then
become one type conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get before. The The Box Jumper
giving you yet another experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful information
for your better life within this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body
and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning an activity. Do you want to
try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Nichol Colby:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What
you need to do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to get a look at some books. One
of several books in the top checklist in your reading list is definitely The Box Jumper. This book which can
be qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up
and review this book you can get many advantages.
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