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It doesn't take a genius to commit a crime, but it takes a special kind of stupid to get yourself caught, as the
criminals in this book prove. This book boasts 50 bite-sized bios with bungling, bone-headed burglars,
embezzlers, and bank robbers. From bragging about your crimes on police Facebook pages to dialing 911
while stealing a car, these people prove that an idiot can commit a crime, but probably shouldn't.
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From reader reviews:

Samantha Bond:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or read a book allowed High Crimes and Low IQs:
50 of the Dumbest Criminals? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend
your time with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you
have various other opinion?

Pat Tran:

The book High Crimes and Low IQs: 50 of the Dumbest Criminals will bring you to definitely the new
experience of reading the book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. When you try to find
new book to see, this book very suitable to you. The book High Crimes and Low IQs: 50 of the Dumbest
Criminals is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so
you can easier to read the book.

Clara Radtke:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this High Crimes and Low IQs: 50 of the
Dumbest Criminals book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that can be
understand by anyone who read the book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
composing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still skepticism High Crimes and Low IQs:
50 of the Dumbest Criminals as good book not simply by the cover but also by the content. This is one
reserve that can break don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to
pick this particular!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already said so why you have to listening
to an additional sixth sense.

Haley Berg:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book but additionally novel and High Crimes and Low IQs: 50 of
the Dumbest Criminals or maybe others sources were given information for you. After you know how the
good a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or even students
especially. Those guides are helping them to put their knowledge. In some other case, beside science reserve,
any other book likes High Crimes and Low IQs: 50 of the Dumbest Criminals to make your spare time much
more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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