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HandsOn By Jaci Burton Lara McKenzie can't believe anyone would want to interview her about placing
first in the annual self-pleasure fundraiser. An educator, she also writes books helping women to achieve
more fulfilling sex lives. Now if only she could fulfill her own! Mark Whitman, freelance reporter, has just
scored an easy assignment-write an article for Total Man Magazine about Lara McKenzie, sex educator and
obvious expert on self-pleasure. He expects to find a bookish geek, not a red-hot redhead! When his one-time
assignment turns into a request for a full-time job writing with Lara, Mark has to lie to Lara to convince her
to co-author the articles. Soon they're steaming up the sheets in the bedroom and on the pages of the
magazine and Mark is in way over his head. The truth may set you free, but Mark's afraid when Lara finds
out the truth, he'll lose not only the job of his dreams, but the woman he loves. Twice Upon A RoadtripBy
Shannon Stacey When the going gets tough, Jill Delaney gets going. . .in the other direction. This time the
other direction has Jill hitching a ride with the senior center's Spring Fling tour to Orlando. Screwed out of a
promotion, she's ready for some fun in the sun before it is time to balance her checkbook again. Ethan
Cooper just wants to get his mother settled into her new job so he can pick up the pieces of his own life. But
first Mom's got a little vacation planned. Now Ethan has to survive a trip with a busload of retirees and one
sexy but infuriating blonde, then he's home free. But when they find themselves stranded and alone, Jill and
Ethan are faced with making their own way south. Fighting scorching sexual desire and each other along the
way, they give in and indulge in a little vacation sex-which doesn't mean they have to fall in love. After all,
Jill's not ready to be domesticated, and Ethan's convinced she's not his type. They never saw the handcuffs
coming. . .Coffee, Tea or Lea?
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From reader reviews:

Alexander Snider:

The book Going the Distance (Ellora's Cave Presents) can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Why then must we leave a very important thing like a book Going
the Distance (Ellora's Cave Presents)? A number of you have a different opinion about publication. But one
aim that book can give many details for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with the book.
Knowledge or information that you take for that, you may give for each other; you can share all of these.
Book Going the Distance (Ellora's Cave Presents) has simple shape but you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can search the enormous world by available and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Neil Myers:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As it is known to us
that book is very important for all of us. The book Going the Distance (Ellora's Cave Presents) was making
you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is extremely
advantages for you. The e-book Going the Distance (Ellora's Cave Presents) is not only giving you a lot
more new information but also to be your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your personal
spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with all the book Going the Distance (Ellora's
Cave Presents). You never truly feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Connie Curtis:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is inside the former life are hard to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the
unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Going the Distance (Ellora's Cave Presents) as your
daily resource information.

Malcolm Thurmond:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition details. Even you love Going the Distance (Ellora's Cave Presents),
you may enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it?
Oh occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.
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